
We are an approved oil, 
filter, container & antifreeze 
drop-off recycling location!

$10.00
OFF ANY FULL SYNTHETIC OIL CHANGE>

$5.00
OFF OR CONVENTIONAL OIL CHANGE>

611 Main St, Winkler
(Next to Co-op Car Wash)

Ph. 204-325-8100
www.viplube.ca

FREE 21 PT. 
INSPECTION

No Appointment Needed

Not valid with other offers. Expires September 30, 2023

PKF Lawyers, Manitoba’s law firm. Providing 

trustworthy, expert, real-world results since 1924. 

Ready to serve today, tomorrow, always. pkflawyers.com
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LOCALLY OWNED HISTORY BOOK FOR THE COMMUNITY

STANDARD PHOTO BY LORRAINE STEVENSON
Alex Harder and her daughter Elise, 2, were among the spectators watching 500 ducks “racing” down 1st Ave. NW to a watery fi nish 

line near Carman Community Hall July 12. Entrants paid $5 per duck and the Carman and Duff erin Fire Department supplied the water 

to create a little river on the street. The event was a fundraiser for the Duff erin Historical Museum. 

Quacking upQuacking up
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YOU ARE INVITED! 
Carman Dufferin Grey 

Planning District 
Development Plan & 

Zoning By-law  
Review Project  
Open Houses

260 MAIN ST. N. CARMAN  204.745.3400

WESTERN & WORK WEAR
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Dale Toews to head up regional water co-op this fall
By Lorne Stelmach

The Pembina Valley Water Co-op 
(PVWC) has landed an experienced 
candidate to take on its lead role.

Dale Toews will be stepping away 
from his role as the chief administra-
tive offi  cer for the RM of Stanley to 
become CAO for the co-op starting 
Oct. 16.

“I have some level of familiarity with 
the PVWC already as Stanley is a part 
of the co-op. They have a very talent-
ed group of people there from opera-
tions, administration and engineering 
and a motivated board,” Toews said 
last week. “I am very much looking 
forward to working with them to con-
tinue the important work of provid-
ing a safe and dependable supply of 
potable water to our growing region.”

Toews takes on this new role with 
the pending retirement of current 
CAO Greg Archibald, who intends to 
step down at the end of the year. 

Given the strategic importance of 
this position, the PVWC board en-
gaged the services of Summit Search 
Group to assist in conducting an ex-
tensive search for the most suitable 
candidate.

Toews emerged in the end clearly as 
the best choice, said board chairper-

son and Rhineland Reeve Don Wiebe. 
The PVWC cited Toews for having 

a strong background related to mu-
nicipal administration and for having 
demonstrated strong leadership and 
project management skills, making 
him an excellent candidate for this 
role.

“We went through quite an exten-
sive search,” Wiebe said. “Dale came 
out on top, and we feel good about it. 
He’s got a good reputation. He’s had 
experience in the municipal world ... 
he’s done some project management, 
so we think he is quite well suited for 
this job.”

Besides the day-to-day operations, 
Toews will be overseeing the capital 
projects that are currently underway, 
such as the new reservoir at the Le-
tellier plant, and he will be taking re-
sponsibility for the new projects that 
are slated to start toward the end of 
year.

The PVWC is owned by 14 member 
municipalities and provides potable 
water to about 60,000 people with 
three water plants at Morris, Letellier 
and Stephenfi eld, and it is a growing 
region and a potable supply of water 
is critical, as is having strong leader-
ship, Wiebe observed.

“It’s a key position ... to manage 
three water plants and serving 60,000 
people ... and there are ongoing proj-
ects in the works, so it’s a big job.

“There’s so many prospects for in-
dustrial growth and immigration pro-
grams, so we’re going to need water,” 
said Wiebe. “We’re quite excited to 
have him join us.”

Toews noted it has been a privilege 
to serve the RM of Stanley for the past 
nearly 15 years. 

“Stanley is a busy municipality, and 
while it has been a demanding role, it 
has also been extremely rewarding,” 
he said. “What will I miss? No ques-
tion, it is the people.  There is a very 
capable staff  team here, and council 
has been encouraging and supportive 
no matter the challenges.

"I really can’t thank both the council 
and staff  enough. Stanley is a strong 
organization in an incredible commu-
nity.”

“Dale has been a really good asset 
for the RM. He has a lot of passion for 
our community and the people ... this 
is a good opportunity for him,” said 
Stanley Reeve Ike Friesen.

“We will still cross paths quite a bit 
because we very much rely on Pem-
bina Valley Water Co-op for a lot of 

 SUPPLIED PHOTO
RM of Stanley CAO Dale Toews will step 

into a leadership role at the Pembina 

Valley Water Co-op this October.

our water,” he added.
As for the municipality, it has al-

ready hired a fi rm to help recruit a 
new CAO, and they are hopeful that 
they can be far enough along in the 
process by the time Toews departs in 
fall.

“We’ll see what we can do by then 
... our staff  is very prepared to handle 
things on their own for a bit. We have 
a very good staff .”
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Staff 
The Duff erin Historical Museum 

held a Duck Race as a fundraiser on 
July 12 at 7 p.m. on 1st Avenue N.W. 
in Carman.  The race was held on 
the street with the assistance of the 
Carman Duff erin Fire Department 
who released water onto the street to 
form a stream of water for the ducks.   
Volunteers from the museum board 
walked alongside the ducks and en-
sured that the no duck got pushed 
out of the stream and left behind.  The 
organizers chose 1st Avenue NW to 
hold the race on because there was 
lots of room for spectators.

There were 500 ducks sold for $5 
each and entered in the race. First 
prize was $125 and was awarded to 
#143 Vic Rance, second $63 to #359 
Bruce Dracass and third $25 to #203 
Jennifer Steward. Irene Stevenson 
(museum president) and Karen Max-
well (museum past president) caught 
the winners as they went through the 
“gate”.   

The Duff erin Historical Museum 
volunteers would like to thank every-
one who supported the fundraiser by 
buying ducks and cheering them on.   
After expenses were paid, the profi t 
was $1800 which will be added to the 
museum’s renovation fund for the 
washroom and storage area.  

Vice president Lori Keith also ex-
pressed her thanks, “to the Carman 
Duff erin Fire Department for creat-
ing a “river” of water on the street, 
the Miami Fire Department for in-
structing, advising and allow us to 
use their “duck catcher”, the Town 
of Carman for allowing us to use the 
street and providing barricades, and 
the Homestead Co-op for allowing us 
to sell ducks at their store on two sep-
arate occasions.   We would also like 
to thank the residents of 1st Avenue 
NW.  We hope that our race did not 

inconvenience you.”    
Feedback received has encouraged 

the organizers to plan for next year 
and will be increasing the number 
of ducks from 500 to 1000 along with 
prizes from three to fi ve. 

 The 2nf Annual Duff erin Historical 

Museum Duck Race will be held on 
Wednesday, July 10, 2024 at 7 p.m. on 
1st Avenue NW.    Ducks will be sold 
earlier this year to make sure that ev-
eryone who wants a duck can have 
one.   “It was a great “fun”raiser as 
well as a fundraiser,” said Keith.

STANDARD PHOTOS SUBMITTED
A large crowd took part in the fi rst Duff erin Historical Museum duck race on July 

12. Organizers raised $1800 that will be used for the museum washroom and 

storage area renovation project. 

The Carman Duff erin fi re department  

created a river using the fi re truck.

Everything was ducky for Museum’s inaugural race

Teeing off in support of SCCR

 STANDARD PHOTO SUBMITTED
The 26th annual Pritchard Memorial golf tournament raised $50,746 for South 

Central Cancer Resource (SCCR).  The memorial event took place at the Carman 

Golf and Curling Club with an online auction, 18 holes of golf, and a steak 

dinner. Accepting the donation on behalf of SCCR is Jack Pethybridge, far left, 

from Al Pritchard, Linda Pritchard, Bob Pritchard and Darren Pritchard. 
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By the Manitoba government
To build an economy that addresses 

today’s challenges and seizes the op-
portunities ahead, Premier Heather 
Stefanson and Economic Develop-
ment, Investment and Trade Minister 
Jeff  Wharton announced today a new, 
long-term economic action plan for 
Manitoba, with targeted initiatives al-
ready underway to meet a shared vi-
sion for sustained growth, increased 
trade, a skilled workforce with good 
paying jobs, and continued progress 
toward economic reconciliation with 
Indigenous communities.

The Opportunities for Economic 
Growth Action Plan capitalizes on 
Manitoba’s competitive advantage as 
the geographic centre of North Amer-
ica, as well as the province’s abundant 
clean energy, excellent transportation 
connections, renowned research net-
works, competitive business supports, 
and a young and skilled workforce.

The plan aligns government depart-
ment initiatives to support Manitoba 
industries in fi lling more than 114,000 
job openings over the next fi ve years. 
It will focus on four key pillars of the 
economy: workforce skills and sup-
ply, critical business and trade infra-
structure, emerging sector growth 
opportunities, and quality of life in-
vestments.

“Through this plan and vision, we 
are going to continue growing our 
economy with investments that create 
more good paying jobs and improve 
the quality of life for Manitobans 
throughout our province,” Stefanson 
said. “This plan will revitalize our 
communities, build vibrant indus-
tries, and make Manitoba a safe and 
aff ordable place to live and work.”

The blueprint for economic growth 
is the result of extensive engagement 
with over 65 economic development 
partners and stakeholders including 
the business and industry commu-
nity, sector councils, post-secondary 
educational institutions, Indigenous-
led organizations, and training and 
employment organizations.

It is a data-informed examination of 
private-sector performance, emerging 
growth areas and workforce needs 

that provided new insights into cur-
rent challenges and future opportuni-
ties. Stakeholder advice, experiences 
and insights shaped the plan and em-
phasized the need for action to create 
the conditions for economic prosper-
ity.

“Manitoba has one of the most di-
verse and balanced economies in Can-
ada,” said Wharton. “It is an economy 
built by an enterprising and innova-
tive private sector and supported by a 
network of partners that, together, are 
essential to the continued growth of 
our economy and workforce.

“Economic growth is one of our gov-
ernment’s highest priorities and the 
successful start of initiatives under 
this action plan showcases our com-
mitment to translating vision into ac-
tion. We will continue to work in close 
partnership with all stakeholders to 
identify and invest in opportunities 
with the greatest potential for eco-
nomic impact.”

In support of the plan, the Manitoba 
government has already made several 
targeted investments as part of Bud-
get 2023 to benefi t and support indus-
try and community growth through-
out the province. These investments 
will:

- attract international talent, recruit 
workers, retain employees and bring 
back students from other jurisdictions 
after graduation;

- enhance the education system by 
developing career pathways for in-
demand apprenticeship trades and 
early childhood educators starting in 
high school;

- expand markets for Manitoba 
goods and services, and strengthen 
the infrastructure to get those goods 
and services to market;

- incentivize employers to upskill 
their workforce and help certify inter-
nationally educated professionals in 
their profession;

- improve Manitoba’s tax system to 
make the personal income and busi-
ness tax environment more competi-
tive with neighbouring jurisdictions, 
and allow businesses and workers to 
keep more of their income;

- revitalize downtown Winnipeg 

through development and heritage 
preservation, and address homeless-
ness through safe housing; and

- support the growth and vibrancy of 
Manitoba arts, culture, sport and tour-
ism.

“Manitoba Transportation and Infra-
structure’s mission is to ensure safe, 
reliable and sustainable infrastructure 
for Manitobans,” said Transportation 
and Infrastructure Minister Doyle Pi-
wniuk. “Our government’s vision and 
strategy is to build on our multimodal 
transportation hub and trade gate-
ways, to create opportunities toward 
a more prosperous future for all those 
residing in Manitoba.”

“Manitoba’s diverse economy con-
tinues to enable a strong labour mar-
ket and we are seeing an increase of 
international migration of skilled 
workers that will help strengthen not 
only Manitoba’s population but also 
increase economic growth and op-
portunities across the province,” said 
Labour and Immigration Minister Jon 
Reyes.

“Manitoba is a beautiful province to 
explore and always off ers something 
new to discover whether you’re a 
fi rst-time visitor or you’ve lived here 
all your life,” said Sport, Culture and 
Heritage Minister Obby Khan. “Mani-
toba’s tourism sector is a vital con-
tributor to our economy – employing 
tens of thousands of people and con-
tributing hundreds of millions of dol-
lars in provincial revenue as we wel-
come visitors to a myriad of activities, 
events and locations.”

“Co-developing approaches to eco-
nomic reconciliation with our Treaty 
partners remains a top priority of 
our government,” said Indigenous 
Reconciliation and Northern Rela-
tions Minister Eileen Clarke. “Indig-
enous tourism in Manitoba must be 
Indigenous-led and with our support 
through this action plan, we can en-
sure this sector is being built upon a 
strong foundation of tradition and 
trust while creating more good jobs 
for Manitobans.”

“Our environment and economy in 
Manitoba are inextricably linked and 

Economic growth action plan will create more jobs and build economy 

Continued on page 6
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Winkler Meats announces $53M expansion plans
By Ashleigh Viveiros

A major expansion project at Win-
kler Meats is going to more than dou-
ble the number of jobs at the facility 
and signifi cantly increase its process-
ing power.

The federal and provincial govern-
ments on Monday announced a fund-
ing commitment of $2.38 million from 
the Sustainable Canadian Agricultur-
al Partnership Capital Infrastructure 
and Investments Program in support 
of the nearly $52.8 million capital 
project.

The Manitoba government has also 
approved over $7.8 million in loan fi -
nancing and tax rebates.

The expansion is a joint venture be-
tween Winkler Meats and Johnson-
ville Sausage, which sources some 
of its live sow supply from Western 
Canada. 

“Today’s announcement of the Win-
kler Meats expansion was over two 
years in the making,” noted Manitoba 
Agriculture Minister Derek Johnson. 
“Through an investment of $52.8 mil-
lion in this project, Winkler Meats is 
doubling the size of its facility and in-
creasing its production capacity.

“The project will add 85 new jobs 
once completed and an additional 23 
jobs in the following three years,” he 
said. That brings the company’s local 

workforce to 155 full-time equivalent 
positions.

The minister noted the project is also 
working with Effi  ciency Manitoba on 
both energy and water savings in the 
design of the project, “thus reducing 
its environmental impact and increas-
ing its long-term sustainability and 
operating effi  ciency.”

The expansion will serve to signifi -
cantly bolster the Canadian supply 
chain and will prevent millions of ki-
lograms of live animals from needing 
to be exported to the United States for 
processing.

“Today, the majority of the Western 
Canadian sow herd is being trans-
ported as live animals to be processed 
in the United States,” Johnson said. 
“The project creates more value here 
in Manitoba by processing the sows 
right here in Winkler. This creates 
new jobs, economic value, and sup-
ports growth of Manitoba communi-
ties.”

It will also signifi cantly reduce the 
greenhouse gases currently generated 
by having to ship animals out of prov-
ince, Johnson noted.

Mayor Henry Siemens said the City 
has been working closely with Win-
kler Meats and Johnsonville on this 
undertaking to ensure the community 
has the capacity to help it succeed.

“When we were fi rst approached 
by the Winkler Meats group to sug-
gest that this might be a possibility, 
our immediate response was yes,” he 
said. “And then we got to work an-
swering all the questions and all the 
requirements that needed to be there. 
Through the dedicated hard work of 
our city staff , we were able to make 
that happen.”

Winkler currently has both water 
and wastewater treatment expansion 
projects in the works. Siemens said 
those projects will be completed in 
time to allow for the increased needs 
this expansion will place on the com-
munity’s infrastructure. 

Through industrial services agree-
ments, Winkler Meats will be making 
signifi cant investments in the capital 
costs of those projects as well as their 
ongoing operation, the mayor noted.

“Every conversation we had with the 
group was how do we work together 
in partnership to move this forward 
more quickly?” Siemens said. “It was 
good to have people at the table who 
were interested in making it work, 
who are prepared to make a very sig-
nifi cant investment into Winkler.”

It’s an exciting step into the future 
for Winkler Meats, shared president 
Jeff  Senebald

“Since the 1960s, Winkler Meats has 

STANDARD PHOTO ASHLEIGH VIVEIROS
Manitoba Ag Minister Derek Johnson 

on Monday announced $2.38 million 

in funding from the provincial and 

federal governments in support of a 

major expansion at Winkler Meats.

grown substantially, sharing our pas-
sion for farmer’s sausage and serving 
others,” he said. “The announcement 
today is an expansion of doubling 
down on our future in the province of 
Manitoba.

“It will be the premier sow harvest-
ing facility in Canada,” Senebald con-
tinued. “It will create new jobs as well 

Continued on page 6
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Carman’s Yard of the Week

 STANDARD PHOTO BY LEORA COLLINGRIDGE 
Communities in Bloom’s July 21 Yard of the Week is awarded to Deanna and Wilf 

Mutcher for their beautiful property on 1st St. SE. This corner lot is pristine, 

showcasing not only fl owers, trees and lawn but also a vegetable garden. Wilf 

and Deanna bought their property in 1999 and their separate responsibilities for 

maintaining it are very well defi ned. Wilf plants the vegetables and tends the 

lawn. Deanna plants and cares for the beautiful fl ower beds. CIB volunteers Paula 

Learmond and Leora Collingridge presented the Mutchers with a hanging basket 

from Vanderveen’s last Friday afternoon. The YOTW lawn sign was created by 

Melissa Emerson-Froebe. 

23074ge1

 PHOTO BY ASHLEIGH VIVEIROS
From left: Minister of Transportation and Infrastructure Doyle Piwniuk, Minister 

of Economic Development and Trade Jeff  Wharton, Winkler Meats president Jeff  

Senebald, Johnsonville Holdings CEO Michael Stayer Suprick, Winkler Mayor Henry 

Siemens, and Agriculture Minister Derek Johnson at the announcement Monday.

as support local economic growth 
and export sales.”

Senebald said they intend to fi ll the 
new positions with local candidates 
fi rst, but, given that our area is cur-
rently experiencing a labour shortage, 
they are prepared to look internation-
ally for skilled workers and are con-
fi dent they will fi nd them. The com-
pany has worked with the Provincial 
Nominee Program successfully in the 
past, he said, noting they have their 
sights set on recruiting most likely 

from the Philippines.
He noted the company is also in 

talks with local developers to ensure 
there is housing available for any 
workers it brings to the community 
in the years ahead.

“It’s likely to be a challenge, but we 
think we‘ve got a lot of plans in place 
to take that on,” Senebald said.

Michael Stayer Suprick, CEO of 
Johnsonville Holdings, noted how 
impressed he was at the support this 
project has received locally.

through critical investments into 
water and wastewater infrastruc-
ture, we continue to be good stew-
ards of both,” said Environment 
and Climate Minister Kevin Klein. 
“By prioritizing the protection of 
precious freshwater resources in 
this comprehensive plan, we can 
ensure we are preserving the pros-
perity and way of life in Manitoba 
for generations to come.”

Supporting the pillars of the Op-
portunities for Economic Growth 
Action Plan and investments to date 
is a commitment to maintaining 
Manitoba’s prudent fi nancial plan-

ning, strong governance and man-
agement, and improved forward 
planning, as recently affi  rmed by 
global credit rating agency Moody’s 
Investor Services.

The plan will evolve and adapt to 
changing economic conditions and 
priorities. An interactive website 
has been developed so Manitobans 
can learn more about each of the ac-
tions and monitor the plan’s prog-
ress.

To view the Opportunities for Eco-
nomic Growth Action Plan , visit 
https://manitoba.ca/jec/oegp/.

“The government just stepped in, 
both Winkler and Manitoba, and really 
made things happen so fast,” he said. 
“I’m still amazed today at how quick-
ly we were able to get wastewater and 
water and the government on our side 
to make things move forward.”

Winkler, Manitoba is the perfect loca-
tion for a project like this, added Sene-

bald.
“The sow herd is here,” he said. 

“There are about 338,000 sows right 
here in Manitoba, and our neighbor-
ing Saskatchewan is probably about 
120,000 sows. So location-wise what 
we’re doing really made sense in Man-
itoba.”

 >  ECONOMIC GROWTH, FROM PG. 4

 >  WINKLER MEATS, FROM PG. 5
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Local company cutting the ribbon on Green Opportunities
By Lorne Stelmach

Jake Penner has now been involved 
in the solid waste industry for three 
decades, but a nagging thought that 
came to him early on has led him to 
change course.

As of Jan. 31, Penner Waste sold 
their hauling and container services 
and their Morden offi  ce location to 
Municipal Waste Management, but 
they continue to operate at their Win-
kler area location, now dubbed  Green 
Opportunities.

They are now focusing on recycling 
and processing of material including 
organic yard waste, construction and 
demolition waste, commercial, resi-
dential, industrial and institutional 
waste and post-consumer organics 
and agricultural by-products as well 
as retail sales of landscaping mulch, 
organic compost, soil and bio fuel 
sales.

“The way we are doing things can’t 
be sustainable. We have to look at 
that and say where did we go wrong? 
How can we turn this all back and 
turn it into a sustainable solution?” 
Penner said last Wednesday as they 
held a re-opening celebration. 

He traced it back to when he fi rst 
started working in a landfi ll at age 18 
and advanced in the solid waste in-
dustry.

“I always looked at the materials 
that were entering the stream and 
started saying why aren’t we doing 
something with this? Why has this 
become landfi ll material?”

He increasingly came to feel it was 
unacceptable, so he thought, “I’ve got 
to get on the other side of the fence 
and see if I can make an impact on 
what we do at the landfi ll.

“Our goal now here at Green Op-
portunities is to starve the landfi lls,” 
said Penner. “The products that we 
manufacture here from organic waste 
is everything from compostable to 
landscaping materials such as mulch 
... and worm casting is one of the big 
ones we’re doing this year. That’s a 
whole new stream that we’re taking 
on ... it’s literally organic fertilizer; it’s 
like a worm poo, and it works amaz-
ing.”

A big motivation for Penner came 
when he recently read how New 
Zealand is now only putting one per 
cent of material into the solid waste 
stream. Canada, in comparison, is not 
anywhere close to that number.

“We’re probably only capturing 
about one per cent out of the waste 
stream ... so how did we go wrong ... 
Canada is one of the leaders in waste 
production,” said Penner.

“When you look at the solid waste 

stream, you’ve got between 30 and 
40 per cent of the solid waste stream 
is actually food waste. Food waste is 
one of the most damaging in green 
ways to landfi lls ... that’s what pro-
duces the methane at landfi lls ... if 
they send it to us, they reduce their 
impact by more than 50 per cent on 
producing methane. That’s the diff er-

ence, and that is huge.”
“Anything that we take here, we try 

to make it what we consider a renew-
able resource ... we can recapture that 
stuff  and retail it back into the market-
place,” said his wife Barb, who very 
much shares Penner’s passion. “Ev-

Continued on page 9
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By Becca Myskiw
Last weekend, the Carman Garden 

Club hosted their annual Garden 
Tour, bringing numerous people to 
gaze at the town’s beauty. 

The Carman Garden Tour typically 
happens on the third Saturday of July 
each year, but they moved it this year 
to avoid confl icting events. 

Charlene Veenendaal of the Car-
man Garden a club said the tour is 
a way the gardeners of Carman can 
share their passion with like-minded 
people. While it invites locals to tour 
their own town, the Garden Tour also 
brings in people from Winkler, Win-
nipeg, and beyond. 

“We say a garden is a work of art 
and everyone has a diff erent appre-
ciation for that,” she said. 

The tour had seven stops this year, 
each garden chosen by garden club 
members or suggested by neigh-
bours. The tour typically features 
private homes so people can have a 
chance to see gardens they wouldn’t 
otherwise see. 

This year, the tour also had Golden 
Prairie Arts Council (GPAC) as a stop 
on the tour so people could look at 
their gardens behind the building 
and view the art inside. The tour also 
highlights local gems as stops for peo-
ple, one being the Boyne Side Pocket 
Park, another being the Boyne River 
Keepers group.

These were the other gardens fea-
tured on this year’s tour:

Les and Agnes Vanderveen (a 
“peaceful and picturesque place to 
enjoy a morning tea or an evening 
barbecue.”)

Bob and Martha Pauls (a “land 
where things are always evolving and 
dreams become reality.”)

Heather Wilton (a glorious farmyard 
with diverse plants and animals.)

Lani and Edward Pritchard (an ur-
ban yard with peonies and lilies as 
their favourites.)

Ron and Debbie Vanderzwaag (a 
micro-climate perfect for an array of 
plants.)

Bernie Townsend and Kathleen An-
derson (a challenging space made 
stunning.) 

The day starts at Ryall Park, where 
garden club members give self-guid-
ed tour booklets and a small vendor 
market is set up. People were able to 
pre-order lunch from Bell Aura Bed & 
Breakfast for the day as well. 

Veenendaal said the tour is a good 
way for gardening enthusiasts to see 
how other gardeners use their spaces. 

“You can see how they’ve used a cer-
tain plant

or if you have a shade space, you 
can learn how other people use their 

STANDARD PHOTOS BY CHARLENE VEENENDAAL
Don serenaded gardeners alike as they made their way around Carman, taking in 

seven gardens unlike one another. This year’s Garden Tour was a success, with the 

perfect weather and timing to see lilies in full bloom. 

Annual Carman Garden Tour a blooming success
shade space,” she said. “The same 
with a hot, dry space.”

Some gardeners incorporate art into 
their gardens or other things that 
aren’t typically in gardens. The Car-
man Garden Club tries to showcase 
the spaces that are the most creative.

“It’s really up to the person that’s 
viewing what they like,” said 
Veenendaal. “It’s just appreciating 
what somebody’s done and how 
they’ve used the space.”

Money from the tickets for the tour 
goes back into the garden club for 
their junior gardening program and 
for their community initiatives. The 
club donates time and resources to 
various local organizations and they 
host gardening presentations for the 
community to attend for free. 

Veenendaal said this year’s tour 
went very well, bringing in lots of 
new faces to see the town. 
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 STANDARD PHOTOS BY LORNE STELMACH
Green Opportunities near Winkler is focusing on keeping as much waste out of 

the local landfi ll as possible for reuse in a myriad of ways.

erything that we sell here has been re-
cycled and given sometimes a second 
full circle of life.”

Jake emphasized the idea of this 
contributing to the idea of a circular 
economy.

“When people send their material to 
us, they know that it’s going to stay 
back in the economy rather than stay 
in the landfi ll ... we’re turning into 
a product that the end-user can use 
again,” he said, citing the example of 
a pallet that becomes mulch which 
goes into fl ower beds and which 
a few years later can come back to 

them again and go into compost per-
haps and be re-used yet again.

“Those  vegetables are going to have 
a higher nutritional content than what 
you’re buying in the stores. A lot of 
people don’t realize how benefi cial it 
is to their food source,” added Barb. 
“Your vegetables that you’re growing 
at home with the compost that you 
brought to our facility is going back 
into your garden, back into your diet. 
So that’s full circle.”

“And our compost is being moni-
tored every single day. We test it for 
the right temperature; we have a 

guideline that we follow, and we meet 
and exceed that guideline. That’s very 
important,” added Jake.

He noted there are a number of com-
munity partnerships contributing to 
their success ranging from  home-
owners and contractors to the City of 
Winkler and Town of Altona.

“We are a very unique company and 
probably one of its kind in the prov-
ince,” he suggested. “We do every-
thing here, and we constantly look 

at new streams that are entering the 
market ... how can we keep that out of 
the landfi ll, and what can we produce 
as another usable product. That’s 
something we constantly have on our 
mind.

“We’ve been growing steady since 
we started ... and when you have a 
passion for it and you believe in it, I 
think that’s important as well ... and 
maybe we can get to that one per 
cent.”

 >  GREEN OPPORTUNITIES, FROM PG. 7
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By Kathy Harness
Thirty years ago at the Carman 

Country Fair, the newly formed Man-
itoba Miniature Horse Club held its 
fi rst annual club show.  There were 
eighteen miniature horses competing 
in thirteen halter and driving classes.  

This year the MMHC returned to 
Carman for its 30th Anniversary show 
with forty-nine horses and twenty 
exhibitors for a total 187 entries in 
the forty-three classes off ered.  By 
the end of the year the club was ini-
tially formed there were 25 member 
families who owned miniature hors-
es.  There are now over 55 families/
individuals who belong to the club.  
Miniature horse shows are now held 
at fourteen summer fairs with two 
new shows being added this year at 
Portage Ex and Virden. As well, two 
Sanctioned shows for the American 
Miniature Horse Registry are held in 
Manitoba each year, with club mem-
bers going on to compete at the Na-
tional Miniature Horse Show in Tulsa 
Oklahoma.

Throughout the years people have 
joined the club as new members, left 
for diff erent pursuits, and rejoined 
the club to participate in the various 
activities.  Rod and Heather Hart of 
Meadowind Miniatures from Carman 
were there at the fi rst meeting and 
show and have remained active in the 
club over the thirty years.  They were 
busy showing again at the 30th anni-
versary show.  

Since the formation of the club, 
members have met annually at a 
spring and fall general meeting as 
well as various functions throughout 
the year.  Each spring the club pro-
vides a display at the Royal Manitoba 
Winter Fair where they do demon-
strations to highlight the versatility 
of the breed.  Clinics are held to pro-
vide instruction at various levels of 
competence --- from beginner to ad-
vanced.  Throughout the summer and 
fall individuals get together to go on 
afternoon drives and to have fun with 
their horses. In mid-July, some mem-
bers take participate in the Milk Run 

--- a series of fi ve fairs/shows held 
in Oak River, Strathclair, Shoal Lake, 
Hamiota and Harding over fi ve con-
secutive days. A trail drive is often 
planned for the fall.  In November 
of each year, following the Annual 
Meeting, an Awards Banquet and pro-
gram honours the members who have 
worked so hard throughout the year 
to bring their horses out to shows, 
parades and care home/school visits.  
Various opportunities are provided 
for members to showcase their horses 
and for interested enthusiasts to get to 
know this wonderful breed better.  

One of the reasons the club has been 
so successful is that there has always 
been an emphasis on the youth and 
those who are beginners.  There is a 
camaraderie that develops among the 
members, and everyone steps up to 
help one another.  

STANDARD PHOTOS BY KATHY HARNESS
Bonnie and Evelie Munro (front) and Ottalie and Melanie Munro (back) of Portage 

la Prairie.

Presley Dinwoodie of Portage la Prairie 

shows off  her ribbon.

Chantelle Parvais of St Claude in the 

youth driving class.

Carman’s Trish Aubin in the Driving class.

Miniature Horse Club still active after 30 years

Rebecca Penner of St Genevieve driving a team.  Gwen Schubert of West St. Paul in the Hunter class. Marissa Nickel of Vita in the roadster class.
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 By Ty Dilello 
La Salle’s Taryn Baertseon has re-

ceived a bursary from Ringette Mani-
toba for the upcoming 2023-24 school 
year.

Baertseon has been a long-time force 
on the ringette ice around central 
Manitoba ever since she started play-
ing at the age of fi ve.

“My mom grew up playing rin-
gette and encouraged both my sister 
and me to play for a few years as we 
learned how to skate, and then let 
us choose if we wanted to switch to 
hockey or not,” said Baertseon. “And 
we both fell in love with the game and 
stuck with it.”

Baertseon grew up playing for the 

MacDonald Wildfi re ringette team. 
She has played on three diff erent AA 
teams over the past seven years in the 
Wild, Angels and Magic.

“I played for the U19AA Magic this 
past season, and it was a great year 
to fi nish off  my AA career as I got 
to play with a lot of the friends I’ve 
made over the years of playing AA,” 
said Baertseon.

After graduating from Sanford Col-
legiate in 2022, Baertseon attended 
the University of Manitoba this past 
year and completed the fi rst year to-
wards her Bachelor of Science degree.

It was recently announced that Baer-
tseon would be receiving a bursary 
from Ringette Manitoba to help with 

her University of Manitoba tuition for 
the upcoming school year.

“The ringette community is so big, 
yet so small, in a way that everyone 
knows everyone. Ringette Manitoba 
is so supportive of its athletes and 
academics, hence why they advertise 
for these Scholarships and Bursaries. 
The bursary I received this year was 
for $500, and I am thrilled and hon-
oured to be selected from the list of 
applicants in the selection process.”

Although she’s in University, Baer-
tseon has no signs of slowing down in 
ringette, as she will continue playing 
next season.

“Due to me aging out this year, I 
sadly am not eligible to return to AA 

ringette. I do plan to play for an Open 
Elite team with a group of the girls 
that I have been playing with for the 
past seven years.”

STANDARD PHOTO SUBMITTED
 Taryn Baertseon, 2022 Sanford 

Collegiate graduate received a 

bursary from Ringette Manitoba for 

the upcoming 2023-24 school year.

Local ringette player receives bursary

By Ty Dilello 
Carman’s Ryan Orchard is off  to the Junior Golf 

Nationals next month in North Bay, Ontario, and is 
looking for fi nancial support to help with the trip.

To pursue his dream, Orchard, a recent Carman 
Collegiate graduate must forego his part-time job 
at the golf course for approximately two weeks at 
roughly $1,200. At Nationals, he will pay his lodg-
ings $1,400, meals $300, and his $600 roundtrip 
driving costs to North Bay. His out-of-pocket mon-
ey will be approximately $3,500.

It is understood that the Manitoba Golf Associa-
tion will provide him $1,300 to cover all his expens-
es and that the Carman Golf and Curling Club will 
subsidize him with $500. This will present Orchard 
with a defi cit of around $2,000 to pursue his dream, 
while representing the Carman Golf and Country 
Club at the highest level of junior golf competition 
in the country.

Carman Golf and Curling Club member Paul De-
schenes has been helping Orchard fundraise for his 
upcoming tournament and trying to get the word 
out to the masses.

“As far as I am concerned, Ryan is representing all 
of us in Duff erin at a national level and requires our 
full support,” said Deschenes.

Deschenes notes how much of a standup person 
Orchard is and that he deserves any potential fi nan-
cial support for his golf endeavours.

“Ryan is just a nice young man who my wife and I 
got to know every time we were met an impossible 
task,” said Deschenes. “We just called Ryan, and 
he would clean our eaves, shovel an exit path for 
us in the winter, etc. He was totally dependable no 
matter the task as we are both in our mid-eighties 
and our ability to do get things done has greatly 
diminished.”

Deschenes never realized until this year that he 
was a superstar golfer until Orchard won the recent 
Carman Men’s Open.

“Ryan’s performance at the club level and provin-
cially made me realize his potential, and I decided 
to help him a little in whatever way I could.”

Contributions can be made for Orchard’s trip to 
Nationals by either mailing or dropping them off  at 
the Carman Golf and Curling Club.

STANDARD PHOTO SUBMITTED
Carman’s Ryan Orchard is off  to the Junior Golf 

Nationals and is looking for fi nancial support to help 

cover the cost of the trip.

Donations in need for local golfer heading to nationals 

 By Ty Dilello 
The Manitoba Premier Softball 

League for junior women’s players 
is in full swing for the 2023 season. 
The Central Energy team is made up 
of players from across Southern and 
Central Manitoba as they compete 
with the best young softball players 
in the province.

The U13 Central Energy team is in 

second place in their league with a re-
cord of 16-8. On July 8, Central Ener-
gy won both games of a doublehead-
er (4-1 and 7-4) against the Smitty’s 
Terminators to wrap up their regular 
season.

The U15 Central Energy squad is 
now in third place in their eight-team 
league with a record of 18-10. Central 
Energy wrapped up their regular sea-

son with a pair of wins (6-2 and 6-0) 
over the Manitoba Thunder on July 
13.  

The U17 Central Energy team is cur-
rently in second place in their eight-
team league with a record of 16-10. 
On July 9, Central Energy split a 
double header on the road against the 
Winnipeg Lightning to wrap up their 
regular season, winning 10-2 and los-

ing 20-13.   
The U19 Central Energy team is cur-

rently in second place in their league 
with a 10-6 record. The Central Ener-
gy squad will now spend the summer 
competing in tournaments, before 
fi nishing up their league matches in 
September. 

Central Energy weekly premier softball roundup
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By Ty Dilello 
The Carman Cardinals of the Border 

Baseball League wrapped up their 
2023 ball season after consecutive 
playoff  losses to the Morden Mud 
Hens.    

In the fi rst round of the playoff s, 
Carman met up with the top-seeded 
Morden squad in a best-of-three se-
ries. In Game 1 on the road on July 20, 
Carman blew a 3-2 lead in the fi nal in-
ning to fall 4-3. 

The Cardinals returned home for 
Game 2 on July 23, but they couldn’t 
muster up the same amount of of-
fense as the opposition as Morden 
won 16-6. 

The Mud Hens will now advance 
to take on the winner of the Altona 
Bisons/Winkler Whips series in the 
East Division fi nal of the Border Base-
ball League playoff s. 

STANDARD PHOTO BY RICK HIEBERT
Mudhens Manny Lantigua tags out Cardinals Doug Whitehead at second base. 

Central Cardinals’ season ends with losses

By Ty Dilello 
Baseball Manitoba announced the 

fi nal rosters for its 2023 Provincial 
Teams on July 19. These teams are 
made up of the top baseball athletes 
and coaches from around the prov-
ince.

Winkler’s Katie Heppner was one 
of the players named to the Manitoba 
provincial Senior Woman’s team. The 
team will train and compete through-
out the summer in preparation for 
the Women’s Invitational Champion-
ships held from July 27-30 in Halifax, 
Nova Scotia.

A multi-sport athlete, Heppner 
spent the winter playing professional 
hockey in Switzerland for Neuchâtel 
Hockey Academy.

“The season in Switzerland was 
pretty good as there was lots of good 
competition against many players 
who are on the national teams and 
have been to multiple Olympics, 
so that was exciting to play against 
them,” said Katie Heppner. “Living 
there was awesome, the food was 
amazing, travelling was so easy to get 
around, the views from everywhere 
you went were stunning, and you get 
to experience the life of a pro hockey 
player.”

Heppner has now shifted her focus 
to baseball this summer, as she has 

strictly been playing with Team Mani-
toba and training with them. This is 
Heppner’s tenth year with the pro-
vincial team for baseball, so she has 
lots of experience as the team gears 
up for the Nationals.  

“Because we come from all over 
the province, we haven’t gotten to-
gether as much as we would like, and 
we don’t really have teams to play 
against. We actually haven’t played a 
game against other teams,” said Hep-
pner. “When we do get together, it’s 
usually a few hours for practice be-
cause we have so much information 
and technical skills to go over.”

Back in Winnipeg now for this up-
coming winter, Heppner is exploring 
her hockey options as she will be go-
ing to Red River College for two years 
as a student in the medical radiologic 
technology program to become an x-
ray technician.

“I’m not sure where I’ll be playing 
yet as there’s not a whole lot of hock-
ey options in Winnipeg after Univer-
sity, but I’ll probably end up playing 
in a senior league.”

Other southern/central Manitoba 
baseball players who made their re-
spectful provincial teams include 
Gavin Buhler (13U), Crosby Matey-
chuk (13U), Hudson Nikkel (15U), 
Ryker Wiens (15U), Kirsten Giesbrecht 

(16U), Haiden Friesen (16U), Jackson 
Friesen (16U), Rhett Peters (16U), Lo-

gan Lesser (16U), Ty Magarrell (17U) 
and Graham Thiessen (17U).

STANDARD PHOTO SUBMITTED
Winkler’s Katie Heppner was recently named to the Provincial Baseball Team for 

the tenth year.

Heppner to represent Manitoba at Women’s baseball Nationals 



SCRAP METAL
Buyer for all farm-

yard scrap, machinery 

and autos. No item 

too large! Best prices 

paid, cash in hand. 

Phone Alf at 204-461-

1649.

AUTOS
Set of 4 Sailun Atrezzo 

all-season tires (size 

185 65 14) mounted 

on rims, plus 2 ad-

ditional rims for sale. 

Tires like new, hardly 

used during 3 years of 

pandemic. $230. Cash 

only. Call Patricia at 

204-407-6099.

HELP WANTED
ROCKY MOUNTAIN 

EQUIPMENT IS HIR-

ING: Parts Techni-

cians, Service Man-

agers, Agriculture 

& Heavy Equipment 

Techs - Journeyman, 

Apprentices and Sales 

roles. View open roles 

www.rockymtn.com/

careers  Possible re-

location and signing 

bonus offered.

BUSINESS SERVICES
Private mortgage 

lender. All real estate 

types considered. No 

credit checks done. 

Deal direct with lender 

and get quick approv-

al. Toll free 1-866-405-

1228 www.fi rstand-

secondmortgages.ca

FLIGHT ACADEMY
Want to learn how to 

fl y? Recreational Pilot 

Program is the best 

way to get started, 

must be 16 years of 

age. Privileges: fl y for 

fun in a certifi ed air-

plane, a home-built 

aircraft or an ultra-

light; fl y by day only 

in Canada with one 

passenger; can eas-

ily add fl oat rating to 

permit. LS Airways 

Flight Academy 204-

651-1402

––––––––––––––––––.

WANTED
Firearms wanted. 

Looking for all un-

wanted fi rearms. Fully 

licensed for both non-

restricted and restrict-

ed. Anywhere from 

individual items to es-

tates. Cash buyer, pay-

ing top dollar. Please 

call or text Adam at 

204-795-2850.

––––––––––––––––––
Wanted old advertis-

ing: dealership signs, 

service station, gas 

pumps, globes, oil 

cans, Red Indian, 

White Rose, Buffalo, 

Husky, Ford, GM, 

Dodge, Tire signs, 

Coke, Pepsi etc. Call 

306- 221-5908.

NOTICES
URGENT PRESS RE-

LEASES - Have a 

newsworthy item to 

announce? An exciting 

change in operations? 

Announcing a scholar-

ship? Though we can-

not guarantee publica-

tion, MCNA will get the 

information into the 

right hands for ONLY 

$35 + GST/HST. Call 

MCNA 204-947- 1691 

for more information. 

See www.mcna.com 

under the “Types of 

Advertising” tab for 

more details.

––––––––––––––––––
Summer/Fall HIRING? 

SOMETHING FOR 

SALE? HAVING AN 

EVENT? Book your 

Blanket Classifi ed Ads 

NOW in the 31 Weekly 

Manitoba Community 

Newspapers to have 

your messaging seen 

all over the province! 

Call 204-467-5836 or 

call MCNA at 204-

947-1691 for more 

details or to book 

ads. MCNA - Manito-

ba Community News-

papers Association. 

www.mcna.com

HEALTH
Are you suffering from 

joint or arthritic pain? 

If so, you owe it to 

yourself to try elk vel-

vet antler capsules. 

Hundreds have found 

relief. Benefi ts hu-

mans and pets. EVA is 

composed of proteins, 

amino acids, minerals, 

lipids and water. Key 

compounds that work 

to stimulate red blood 

cell production & car-

tilage cell regenera-

tion & development. 

Stonewood Elk Ranch 

Ltd., 204-467-8884 

or e-mail stonewood

elkranch@mymts.net

Cont. on next col.

Classifi eds SSTANDARDTANDARD
The Carman-DufferinBook Your Classifi ed Ad Today 

- Call 204-467-5836 classifi eds@
carmanstandard.ca

Reporter/Photographer
Wanted

Are you a natural born storyteller with an eye for 
photography and a passion for community news?
Carman-Dufferin Standard is currently seeking 
a full-time reporter and photographer to join 
its multi award-winning weekly community 
newspaper. 
We are looking for someone who is both 
motivated and passionate about being the best 
outlet of interesting and breaking news stories 
and event coverage in the Carman-Dufferin area 
and surrounding area communities. 

Qualifications: 

or equivalent experience in a related field

interest in social media 

news judgement 

to consistently source and write a wide range 
of stories and cover events in a fair, balanced 
and accurate manner

on a flexible work schedule including both 
evenings and weekends to meet our weekly 
editorial deadline

meetings 

 Knowledge of CP Style and about the Interlake 
and its surrounding communities would be an 
asset 

Please forward your resumé along with 
three writing and photography samples to:

Lana Meier

STANDARD
The Carman-Dufferin

UNDER THE AUTHORITY OF THE PLANNING ACT

NOTICE OF PUBLIC HEARING
On the date and at the time and location shown below, a 
PUBLIC HEARING will be held to receive representations 
from any persons who wish to make them in respect to the 
following matter:

APPLICATION FOR CONDITIONAL USE
under the RM of Grey Zoning By-Law #05-03 or 

Village of St. Claude Zoning By-Law No. 375-04 as amended.

HEARING Haywood Community Hall
LOCATION: 39 St. Augustine Street Haywood, MB

DATE & TIME: August 17, 2023; 7:00 PM  

APPLICATION: 06CU22G

OWNER: Harmen & Jeltje Van Kammen

APPLICANT: Combcroft Inc.

PROPOSAL:  To expand an existing dairy operation by 
increasing the number of mature cows 
(lactating and dry) from 255 (510 Animal 
Units) to 400 (800 Animal Units).

AREA   NW 11-08-06-W
AFFECTED: 43161 Road 32W
  RM of Grey  

FOR   Kim MacLellan 
INFORMATION Coordinator of Planning Services
CONTACT:  Carman Dufferin Grey Planning District
   204-745-2509

A copy of the above proposal and supporting material may 

hours, Monday to Friday.  Copies may be made, and extracts 
taken therefrom, upon request.

because of a disability or a medical need. 

Pursuant to Sec� on 194 of The 
Municipal Act, no� ce is given that the 
Consolidated Financial Statements for 
the year ended December 31, 2022, for 
the Rural Municipality of Duff erin are 
available for inspec� on by any person 
during the regular offi  ce hours of the 
Rural Municipality of Duff erin offi  ce at 
12-2nd Ave SW, Carman or on our website at 
www.carmanmanitoba.ca. Dated at the 
Rural Municipality of Duff erin this 30th day 
of June, A.D. 2023.

Sharla Murray, CMMA
Chief Administra� ve Offi  cer

Rural Municipality of Duff erin

RURAL MUNICIPALITY 
OF DUFFERIN

PUBLIC NOTICE 
REGARDING THE 

AUDITOR’S REPORT

Monday, Wednesday, Friday – 
1:00 p.m. to 4:00 p.m.

Tuesday & Thursday - CLOSED 
Saturday -

11:00 a.m. to 4:00 p.m.

Used Oil & Antifreeze 
 ECO CENTRE & 

TRANSFER STATION HOURS
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TOWN OF CARMAN
PUBLIC NOTICE

 Town of Carman staff will 
be flushing fire hydrants 

commencing August 14, 2023, 
until the end of September.  

Some cloudiness to your 
water may occur, 

however the quality of the 
water will NOT be affected. 
If you have any questions, 

please call the 
Town of Carman office 
at 204-745-2443 or the 
Water Treatment Plant 

at 204-745-2481.
Book Your Classifi ed Ad Today - 

Call 204-467-5836



14   The Carman-Duff erin Standard   Thursday, July 27, 2023

TAKE NOTICE that the Rural Municipality of Grey intends to 
enact a By-Law pursuant to Section 290 of The Municipal Act 
to close and convey a portion of a Public Road, which is located 
within the Rural Municipality of Grey and legally described as 
follows:
A portion of D. Bruneau Rd. 45.1N in the SW 22-8-7 WPM 

and convey same to the adjacent property owner
AND FURTHER TAKE NOTICE that the Council of the Rural 
Municipality of Grey intends to consider and enact a By-Law 
to close and convey that portion of the said Public Road at its 
meeting and public hearing to be held on Wednesday, August 
16, 2023 at 11:00 a.m.
AND FURTHER TAKE NOTICE that anyone who claims that 
his land will be prejudicially affected by the enactment of this 
By-Law and who applies to make a representation, ask ques-
tions or register an objection, may appear before Council at the 
public hearing and be heard.
Copies of the above road closing and supporting material may 
be inspected by any person between 8:30 a.m. and 4:30 p.m., 

East, Elm Creek, Manitoba, R0G 0N0, Phone:  204-436-2014.  
Copies may be made and extracts taken therefrom
Dated the 14th day of July, 2023.

Kim Arnal, CMMA

Rural Municipality of Grey

NOTICE OF CLOSING 
AND CONVEYING A 

PUBLIC ROAD

23074gm4

BECAUSE WE CARE... ABOUT OUR CUSTOMERS, 
EMPLOYEES AND THE COMMUNITIES WE LIVE IN

Insurance Broker – Carman, MB
Hours of operation are Monday to Friday (8:30am to 5:30pm) 
and Saturday Rotation (9:00am to 3:00pm)

Our Carman Branch is seeking a licensed Insurance Broker, 
someone who is looking for a new challenge and opportunity!
Our Insurance Brokers are brand ambassadors who possess a 
high level of skill to provide top tier insurance experience for 
those who live and work in our surrounding communities. As 
part of our team, a BSI insurance broker is responsible for       
counselling and assessing risk in Autopac, Personal Lines,        
Commercial and Farm policies. With our strong knowledge of 
insurance markets, products, and pricing with support from our 
teams, we match a client’s risk needs with the correct product. 
We want our brokers to use a high level of risk assessment skills 
to provide insurance solutions off all kinds to deliver an                    
exceptional customer service that meets our Company Core    
Values:

C – Communication | Community A – Ambition | 
Passion R – Respect | Teamwork E – Ethics | Integrity

Candidates require an aptitude for learning; excellent                      
communication and interpersonal skills in speaking and writing; 
a commitment to problem-solving; a professional demeanor 
and a high level of personal integrity. Entry level candidates will 
be considered for this position, but you must be committed to 
achieving a Level 1 Brokers License and ready to pursue Level 2 
after. If you already have a license that is great, and we’ll help 
you get to the next level. BSI is prepared to offer financial               
incentives beyond base salary for ideal candidates.

Previous insurance experience and post secondary education in 
business are not necessary but beneficial. We are willing to train 
the right individual with a genuine interest in becoming an        
insurance professional.

BSI offers competitive wages, a great working environment, 
training & development, profit sharing bonuses, health benefits, 
matched RRSP/DPSP plan, annual performance increases and a 
day off on your birthday.

If you are looking for an exciting new opportunity working with 
an exceptional team, please email your resume: careers@bsimb.
com. Please reply by July 21, 2023.

We thank all applicants, however, only those under                                      
consideration will be contacted.

IN THE MATTER of the ESTATE of 
WILLIAM ROBERT HILL, late of the 
Town of Carman, in Manitoba, deceased.

All claims against the above Estate, duly 
verified by Statutory Declaration, must 
be filed with the undersigned at 309 
Stephen Street, Morden, Manitoba, R6M 
1V1,within thirty (30) days of the date of 
this publication.

DATED at the City of Morden, in Manitoba 
this 18th day of July, 2023.

 McCULLOCH MOONEY 
JOHNSTON SELBY LLP
Attention: HARLEY SHEPHERD
Solicitors for the executors
                                      

NOTICE TO CREDITORS

Classifi eds SSTANDARDTANDARD
The Carman-DufferinBook Your Classifi ed Ad Today 

- Call 204-467-5836 classifi eds@
carmanstandard.ca

Contact Joyce 204-626-3310 
or Edith 204-745-3077

Home Grown Home Baked 
Home Made

CARMAN

Open Every Friday until Sept 15th  
4 – 6:30 p.m.

Dufferin Agricultural Building at the fairgrounds
All goods locally produced 

Book Your Classifi ed Ad Today - 
Call 204-467-5836Please support our advertisers SHOP LOCAL



IN MEMORIAM

Pat Baleja
October 24, 1928 – July 27, 2022

It’s been one year since by bucket overturned

Now I will try to refi ll it;

With the 63 years we shared together

I’ve cherished every one of them

And you will be forever in my heart.

-Miss you,

Marian

Your memory will live forever 
Engraved within our hearts

OBITUARY

Melinda (Millie) Bell
It is with great sadness that we announce that Melinda (Millie) 

Bell born February 14, 1934 passed away peacefully with family 

by her side on July 15, 2023 at the Carman Memorial Hospital at 

the age of 89.

Left to mourn Millie are her children Darlene (Mike) Fardy, Blake 

(Tamera) Bell, Rob (Janet) Bell , grandchildren Jamie, Regan 

(Devon), Matthew (Kristine), Courtney, Tyler, great grandchildren 

Cole, Roczen, Landon and Parker. Also remembered by her 

brother and sister-in-law Jack and Mary Hill, sisters-in-law Doreen 

Hill, Ruth Wold and numerous nieces and nephews.

Millie was predeceased by her beloved husband Hugh of 52 

years, her parents Tom and Rose Hill, Hugh’s parents Peter and 

Lillian Bell, sisters Betty (Adelard) Barthelette, Barbara McCulloch, 

brothers Bob Hill, Bill (Edna) Hill, sisters-in-law Alice (Allie) 

McTavish, Mabel (Sterling) Amos, Edith Bell, brothers-in-law Bob (Helen) Bell and Hermann Wold.

Millie was born in Winnipeg, MB. After she completed her schooling she moved to Calgary 

for a short time and then in 1958 moved to Winnipeg where she worked as a Switch Board 

Operator at MTS. In 1959 Millie met her life partner Hugh and were married on April 2, 1960. After 

their wedding Millie moved to Roland where her and Dad farmed and raised their family until 

retirement then moved to Carman.

Millie was very involved with both Myrtle and Roland communities and was a long time 

4-H leader with the Myrtle 4-H club. Mom enjoyed knitting, sewing and many other crafts. 

She especially loved making special quilts for each of her children, grandchildren and great 

grandchildren. In her spare time she loved going to Bingo and especially enjoyed calling bingo 

at Monday afternoon bingo at Meadowood Estates. She also enjoyed watching sporting events 

of her children and grandchildren.

Mom, you will always be deeply loved, sadly missed and always remembered as a devoted 

wife, mother, grandmother, great grandmother and friend. We will wrap ourselves tighter in our 

quilts and forever cherish the memories.

The family would like to thank the staff at Carman Memorial Hospital for their wonderful and 

compassionate care that mom received.

Cremation has taken place.

In respecting Mom’s wishes there will be no formal funeral. A private immediate family gathering 

will be held at a later time.

In lieu of fl owers, donations may be made to the Carman Memorial Hospital Palliative Care, Box 

610, Carman MB. R0G 0J0.

Doyle’s Funeral Home

in care of arrangements

www.doylesfuneralhome.ca

The Carman-Duff erin Standard   Thursday, July 27, 2023    15

Call 204-467-5836Call 204-467-5836

BizBiz
CardsCards

6. Not standing
7. Chinese philosophy
8. Computer giant
9. A device to catch
10. Emits coherent radiation
11. Actor O’Neill
12. Smallest interval in western 

music
13. Not lower
15. Revolves
18. Leavened bread
21. Number above the line in a 

fraction
24. Cable
26. Adult male
27. Airborne (abbr.
30. Bullfi ghting maneuvers
32. Broadcast
35. __ Angeles

37. Vehicle
38. Not religious
39. North American peoples
42. A baglike structure
43. Body art (slang)
46. Picked for a role
47. Actress Tomei
49. Former hoopster “Big Country”
50. Icelandic poems
52. More pleasant
54. It can add fl avor to meat
55. Self-immolation by fi re rituals
57. Expression of annoyance
59. __ Spumante (Italian wine)
62. Consumed
63. Body part
66. Thus
68. In reply (abbr.)

CLUES ACROSS
1. Bonus materials
7. Formal names
13. Free from restraints
14. One who scrapes away
16. Type of device
17. Skin cancers
19. The Show Me State
20. Plate glasses
22. Red-brown sea bream
23. Small (Fr.)
25. Flightless Australian birds
26. High IQ group
28. Stiff structures
29. Revolutions per minute
30. Where a bachelor lives
31. Licensed for Wall Street
33. A place to park
34. Energy, style and enthusiasm
36. An important creed in Catholic 

Church
38. 18-year astronomical period
40. Furies
41. Removes from the record
43. Noted child psychiatrist
44. Feline
45. High schoolers’ test
47. Not happy
48. They __
51. On top
53. Precious stones unit of weight
55. Moved quickly
56. Seagulls
58. A seed with hooks or teeth
59. Partner to “oohed”
60. Exclamation of surprise
61. Most unpleasant
64. Organization help service 

members
65. Type of cockatoo
67. Humorous criticisms
69. Went through and organized
70. Wakes up
CLUES DOWN
1. Settle in tents
2. Big
3. Books
4. Masses of eggs in fi sh
5. Language

take a break
> GAMES
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Classifi eds

Book Your Classifi ed Ad Today - Call 467-5836 
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FIND THE 
RIGHT 

PERSON FOR 
THE POSITION

with an  
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CAREERS AD in

467-5836
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The Carman-Dufferin



Do you have a Health 
or Wellness Business?

Call  
204-467-5836 
to advertise

> MEAL IDEAS> M

Recipe courtesy of Safeway and Albert-
sons

Total time: 30 minutes
2 cloves garlic
1/2 small bunch Italian (flat-leaf) pars-

ley
1/4 cup O Organics extra-virgin olive 

oil
1/8 cup red wine vinegar
2 teaspoons O Organics Dijon mustard
1/2 teaspoon salt
1/2 teaspoon black pepper
3/4pound O Organics ribeye steak
1/2 pint O Organics grape tomatoes
1/4 pound O Organics white mush-

rooms
green pepper, sliced (optional) 
1/2 medium red onion
6 skewers
Peel and mince garlic. Wash and dry 

parsley. Shave leaves off stems; discard 

stems and mince leaves.
In large bowl, whisk minced garlic, half 

the minced parsley (reserve remain-
der for garnish), olive oil, vinegar, Dijon 
mustard, salt and pepper.

Cut steak into cubes; transfer to mari-
nade bowl and toss to coat.

Wash tomatoes, mushrooms and green 
pepper. Halve mushrooms. Add toma-
toes, mushrooms and green pepper 
to marinade. Peel onion and cut into 
chunks; add to marinade. Toss beef and 
vegetables until well coated.

Heat grill pan, outdoor grill or skillet to 
medium-high heat.

Thread steak and vegetables onto six 
skewers. 

Cook kebabs in batches until steak is 
browned and vegetables are tender, 3-5 
minutes per side. Transfer to plate and 
repeat with remaining kebabs.

To serve, plate kebabs and sprinkle 
with remaining minced parsley. 

Photo courtesy of Getty Images (kebabs)

Ribeye Steak, Grape 
Tomato and Mushroom 

Kebabs

Recipe courtesy of Safeway and Albert-
sons 

Total time: 20 minutes
3/4 pound boneless, skinless O Organ-

ics chicken breasts
1/4 teaspoon salt
1/8 teaspoon black pepper
2 teaspoons O Organics extra-virgin ol-

ive oil
1 package (5 ounces) O Organics spring 

mix
1 package (6 ounces) O Organics blue-

berries (or desired berry)
1/4 cup O Organics pecan halves
3 tablespoons O Organics olive oil
1 tablespoon O Organics balsamic vin-

egar
1/2 log (4 ounces) O Organics goat 

cheese
Pat chicken dry with paper towels and 

place on cutting board. Cut chicken in 
half horizontally to form thin cutlets. 
Season with salt and pepper on both 
sides.

Preheat grill pan, outdoor grill or skillet 
to medium-high heat.

Once pan is hot, coat with oil. Add 
chicken to pan and grill, turning once, 
until cooked through, 3-4 minutes per 
side.

Wash and dry spring mix. Place in me-
dium bowl.

Wash and dry blueberries. Add to bowl 
with mixed greens. Using clean cutting 
board, roughly chop pecans. Add to bowl.

Transfer cooked chicken to cutting 
board and cut into thin strips.

In bowl, mix olive oil and balsamic vin-
egar to create dressing. 

Add chicken and dressing to salad 
bowl; toss to combine.

To serve, divide salad between plates or 
bowls and crumble goat cheese over top.

Recipe courtesy of Safeway and Albert-
sons 

Total time: 10 minutes
Yield: 3 cups
1 banana
1/2 package (6 ounces) O Organics 

blackberries
1/2 lime
2 cups O Organics frozen mixed berries
1 cup plain O Organics Greek yogurt

Grilled Chicken Salad 
with Goat Cheese, Fresh 
Blueberries and Pecans

By Susie Schwartz
Are you a complainer? Come on. 

Be honest.

pleasure (or at least relief) in rant-
ing about how my six-foot-frame 
must be invisible because not one 
but three people cut in front of me 

-

-
ing about the cost of parking to your 

parking lot costs are below their 

a ‘whining about inconsequential 
things’ tone when I’m hoping for a 

complain formally. Maybe a test you 

-

can settle.

The verbal processing will help you 

say it.
- Try to stay calm even while be-

-
sponsibility.

- Be sure to speak to the right peo-
ple.

-

It might seem like I’m overthinking 
-

mistakes like the best of us but is 
also a key person to getting the best 

-
-

-

-
-

-

-

Susie Schwartz

Expert patient here to help!

4 fluid ounces O Organics whole milk
1/8 cup O Organics honey
1/4 teaspoon ground cinnamon
2/3 cup O Organics granola of choice
Wash and dry banana and blackber-

ries.
Peel and thinly slice banana; set aside.
Zest and juice lime into blender. Add 

frozen mixed berries, yogurt, milk, 
honey and cinnamon. Blend on high 
speed until smooth, 1-2 minutes.

To serve, divide smoothie between 
bowls and top with banana, blackber-
ries and granola.

Mixed Berry-Lime 
Smoothie Bowl with 
Banana and Granola
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